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2025 TIMBER SALES OFFERED

2025

“.120” sales ~--==========--= 47

, B. Foster 4

“.115” sales -----===========--0

y‘ 2025: 3 DFFP TIMBER SALE AUCTIONS

“.I I 8 ” sales-------------------3

“OTC” sale------========c=uuu-f

f sales: sawlog, fuelwood and salvage from the Pogo

Road Fire (2023, near Delta Junction) and the Nenana Ridge Complex of

fires (2025, near Fairbanks/Nenana)

Offeringa mixo

&

/e
as

-’

e

" - ;' .
A%
Yo

e s

- '
.-

Nenana Ridae Meanv: &

#*Fairbanks-Delta Resource ForesterA. Allaby.

foose

th strong demand for “small-scale” sales

tnues wi

Trend cont



\(ADW‘S"ON OF FOBE

WIS LFIRE PROTECTIO) TRy

FAIRBANKS-DELTA AREA

8 Lot ¥
. a ACTIVE “.118 SALES”

3 | fg + JackFrostLogworks:
al : E 4,771 CCF of spruce sawlog under contract
434 i B g 141 acres for 10 yearsin the Rosie Creek area
fé & i 28 &1 AlaskaBirch Works:
a i e ! 2,939 CCF of birch fuelwood under contract

[ | D 5 124 acres for 10 years in the Nenana Ridge area

" ~ar. ,‘j - Evergreen/Bond Brothers:

i K 0 & 14 4 5,381 CCF of spruce sawlogs near Anderson
. d b % 5 ( 247 acres for 3 years, with option to extend to 10 years
%
X NORTHLAND WOOD PRODUCTS “.118 SALE”
}”‘ DFFP received arequestfor “.118 sale” in December of 2025
W"" “ i W : ; Currently identifying project areas to provide ~200 acres/year to NWP
¢ | : & ‘ " AP " Contract willlikely require new all-season road construction

A Allaby, 2025
e WL |
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OTHER 2025 HIGHLIGHTS

* New, 5-year Master Agreement with FutureForests, LLC for seedling planting
services
2025: 100 acres planted with 40,000 WS seedlings inthe 2023 Pogo fire scar

* Pete Simpson Memorial Road final plat has been submitted to the FNSB for approval
ESTABLISHES DFFP’S LEGAL ACCESS TO TVSF SUBUNIT 4A
TVSF 4A: ~51,000 ACRES, NOROAD ACCESS CURRENTLY

2005, B. Foster
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AUCTION #1
FAIRBANKS

Timber Sale Offerings
10/03/2025,
Oral Outcry Auction

Sale Name

Product &
Species 1

Volume 1

Product &
Species 2

Volome 2

Appraised
Stumpage

Performance
Bond

Improvement

Costs

"‘I‘"mmd*“m Winning Bid High Bidder

Halfway Spruce #1

Spruce sawlog,
all-zeazon

333

Spruce
fuelwood

3l

$11,571.05

$2.000

31,670

$0.901.53 $9.901.53

Aaron Gregoire

Fortune Creek Mixed
#1

Birch fuelwood

Spruce sawlog,
all-zeason

39

$3,738.90

$700

50

$3,738.99 $3,738.90 Alyssa Millard

Jenny M Hill Spruce
#3

Spruce sawlog,
all-zeazon

Birch fuelwood

$6,758.00

$1,000

$3,563.50

Little Ag Spruce #2

Spruce sawlog,
all-zeason

MWixed
fuelwood

$4.538.73

$750

$2.94873

Two Bivers Bidge
Birch

Birch fuelwood

MNone

§303204

$3.032.04

Cache Mile & Spruce
72

Spruce sawlog,
all-zeazon

Iiixed
fuelwood

$8.57331

§8.57331 $8.57331 Ben Chnistenzon

Lincoln Brrch 2

Birch fuelwood

None

$4.888.40

$3.497.15 $3.497.15 Alyssa Millard

Cache Pomt Mixed 52

Spruce sawlog,
all-zeazon

Birch fuelwood

$3,156.33

$3,156.33 $5,156.33

Alyssa Millard
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Product& | _. Product & : Appraised | Performance | Project Improvement Minimuom T e #of Bidders
Sale Name Species 1 ! nhl]me Species 2 Volume 2 | Acres Stumpage Bond Bond Costs Rid* Winning Bid High Bidder
Keystone Bluff Fire ST 79 None 0 137 | $1,580.00 $500 $0 $0 $1,580.00 $1,580.00 Gerad Bak 1
Salvage #1 fuelwood
Rowland #7 Fire Mixed 520 Nons 0 | 1039| $10,400.00 $1,500 $1,000 $2.783 $7.617.30 $7.617.50 Joe Chapman .
Salvage fuelwood
Pogo Mile 6 Fire sdbos 116 None 0 233 | $2,320.00 $500 $0 $0 $2,320.00 $2,500.00 Gerad Bak 2
Salvage fuelwood
Cummngs..East Spruce | Spruce sawlog, 103 Spruce 1% g7 $3,880.80 $200 $0 50 $3.880.20 $3.880.8¢ Nikita Kuzmin 1
#l all-season fuelwood
Keystone Bluff Fire slesd )y None 0 | 481 | $4.82000 $1,000 $0 0 §4.820.00 $4,820.00 Gerad Bak 1
Salvage #1 fuelwood
Pogo Mile 8.5 Fire Mixed 80 None 0 159 | $1.600.00 $750 30 50 31,600.00 $1,600.00 Caleb Parker 1
Salvage fuelwood
Woodstove Spruce #2 Spruce sawlog, 73 Spruce 13 3.6 $2.681.99 $300 30 $0 32,681.99 - 0
all-season fuelwood
Cummmngs Mile 3 Spruce sawlog,| 55 Spruce 12 28 | $2.009.91 $300 $0 $0 §2,099.91 $2,009.91 Nikita Kuzmin 1
Spruce all-zeason fuelwood
Quartz Mile 4 Birch Birch fuelwood| 112 None 0 17 | $2,48864 $730 $0 50 §2,438 64 - 0
Pogo Mile 8.2 Fire Mixed 03 Noge 0 180 | $1,900.00 $750 30 $0 §1,900.00 $1,900.00 Gerad Bak .
Salvage fuelwood
Pogo Mile 12 Salvage Mixed - _ o
- S— 42 None 0 - $240.00 $300 30 50 $2840.00 $1,000.00 Larmry Dorshorst 2

Timber Sale Offerings
9/30/2025, Oral Outcry Auction
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Sale Name Product/Species 1 Volume 1 | Froduct/Species 2| yiolume 2 | Acres 5&[;:,# ) ;::;nm an: Péﬂr:;?m Bﬂtm Winning Bid High Bidder | Bidders | Increase
Cummings Rd Ext Spruce sawlog, all- Spruce
Spruce &2 cencon 923 - 154 501 | $33,197.49 $4,000 $1,000 $3,498.00 $29,699.49 NO BID 0 nfa
Underwear Ridge Spruce sawlog, all- Mixed A& TLAND
Spruce season 1915 | fuehvood 507 | 869 | $72,62645 |  $8,000 | 4000 | $20023.32 | $52,603.13 | $55400.00 | SFRVICES 2 53%
5 all-
Cache Point Mixed | 7' o iiwiogs 357 | Birchfuelvood | 64 | 207 | $13,070.99 | 1500 | S1100 | $558487 | $7,48612 | S11.550.00 | DANPOWELL | 3 54.3%
5 log, all- NORTHLAND
Keystone Creek Mixed | somson - 2210 | Birch fuelwood | 584 | 127.5| $85088.78 | $10,000 | $2,500 | $12,720.00 | $72.368.78 | $72.368.78 WOOD 1 0.0% A U c I IO N # 3
Spruce sawlog, all- NORTHLAND
Jenny M Hill Spruce #4 ceason 1,027 | Birchfuelwood | 173 | 338 | $37355.07 $5,000 $1,400 $6,757.50 | $30,507.57 | $30507.57 WOOD 1 0.0%
Chena Islands Spruce Spruce Sawlog, ) NORTHLAND
i whater 368 | Birchfuehvood | 106 | 146 | $13042.04 |  $1,000 S1,600 | $8109.00 | $4933.04 | $4.933.04 WOOD 1 0.0%
Spruce sawlog, all- Mixed
Little Ag Spruce #3 season 242 fushnood 3 150 | 5875646 51,200 5600 52,981.25 $5,775.21 NO BID 0 n/a
) Salvage Spruce _ GREG e
Bonanza Salv age #1 Sawlog 2 None 0 0.4 $122.35 5250 $0 $0.00 $122.35 $122.35 MCDANIFL 1 0.0% The “fuelwood auct lon”
Salvage Spruce Salvage hlixed A& TLAND
Bonanza Salvage #2 Sawlog 128 Fuelwood 7 103 | $3237.16 $600 80 $0.00 §3,237.16 $3,237.16 SERVICES 1 0.0% T. ®
Salvage S Salvage Mixed A & T LAND b s l Off g
Bonanza Salvage 3 Sewtoy 307 = 17 | 248 | s776729 |  s1.600 $0 $0.00 $7.76720 | $776729 | SFRVICES 1 0.0% imoer caie erings
Salvage S Salvage Mixed A& TLAND e
Bonanza Salvage #4 Sawlog 156 b s | 126 | s3937.32 $800 $0 $0.00 $393732 | $393732 | ‘SERVICES 1 0.0% 12/17/720 25’ Oral Outcrg Auction
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed A& TLAND
Bonanza Salvage #5 Sawlog 556 Fuelwood 0| 449 | $14,05532 $2.000 $0 $0.00 $1405532 | $14,05532 SERVICES 1 0.0%
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed
Bonanza Salvage 86 Sawlog 152 Fustwood B 123 £3,339.44 SO0 50 £0.00 53 B39.44 MO BID 0 nfa
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed
Bonanza Salvage 7 Sawlog 291 Fusiwaood 16 235 5736077 51,500 50 50.00 5736077 MO EID 0 n/a
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed
Bonanza 3alvage 58 Sawlog 80 Fuetwood 4 65 5201760 5500 S0 £0.00 52,017.60 MO BID 0 n'a
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed
Bonanza Salvage 59 Sawlog 136 Fuelwood 7 110 53,43292 £700 50 $0.00 5343252 MO BID 0 n/a
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed
Bonanza Salvage #10 Sawlog 418 Fuetniood yE! 338 | 51057346 $2,000 50 50,00 $10,573.45 NO BID 0 nfa
) Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed CREG
Bonanza Salvage #11 Sawlog 26 Fuelwood 1 21 | $65122 $500 30 $0.00 $651.22 $651.22 \CDANIEL 1 0.0% o
Salvage Spruce Salvage Mixed CGREG ' .
Bonanza Salvage #12 Sawlog » Faelwood 1 18 | $55334 $500 50 $0.00 $s5334 | sL10000 | =R 2 98.8% (@)
) Salvage Spruce Salvage hlixed GCREG
Bonanza Salvage #13 Sawlog 21 Fuelwood 1 17 | ss2887 $500 $0 $0.00 $528.87 $52887 |\ rCpANIEL 1 0.0%
Salvage § Salv Mixed
Bonanza Salvage #14 Savlen 11 Fatrood 1 09 | $284.17 $250 $0 $0.00 $284.17 $284.17 “&RAIE&L 1 0.0%
Bonanza Salvage #16 SH'F‘LZEIEEC;T’ None 0 15 $225.00 5250 50 50.00 $225.00 NO BID 0 nfa
Bonanza Salvage #17 EE':LE':::;‘"D?“ None 0 27 $450.00 5500 50 50.00 $450.00 MO BID 0 nfa
Bonanza Salvage #18 samﬁifo‘;‘” 24 Mone 0 22 $560.00 5250 50 50.00 $360.00 NO BID 0 n/a
Bonanza Salvage #19 Sanlvﬂﬁi:qc:aw 17 None 0 14 $255.00 5250 50 $0.00 $255.00 NO BID o n/a
Bonanza Salvage 20 EEL‘LELEIZ:""DT’ 14 None ] 15 5210.00 $250 50 50.00 $210.00 NO BID o n/a
Bonanza Salvage 21 SEL‘LZE&:‘D?" g Mane o 12 $135.00 $250 50 50.00 5135.00 NO BID o n/a
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Young'’s timber

Under the long term negotiated sale,
343 acres, 5,775 ccf of spruce sawlogs and fuelwood in 8 units
along the Tok River with all-season and winter access

Fall 2025, work commenced on new roads and landings for 3 units

Winter, 2025 YTI purchased a TimberPro (2017) with a Waratah processing

unit increasing their production capabilities
DFFP is moving forward with planning process for approx. 80 acres within
the Clearwater Drainage (tributary of Tok River)
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| Reforestation

|» 77 acres of regeneration surveys completed among four units along the Tok River
« All units were associated with NC-837-T and are regenerating (stocked) to DFFP standards
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